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Abstract 

Background: It has been observed that some Nigerian Families that immigrated to North America (NINA) seem 
to have very stressful marital relationships that lead to separation or divorce. The goal of this study was to 
determine the level of marital satisfaction among NINA 

Method: A simple, standardized survey tool was utilized to measure the index of marital satisfaction (IMS). The 
score varied from 0-100 with a lower score (<30 points) indicating marital satisfaction. A demographic 
questionnaire was also administered to the subjects. Descriptive data analysis and level of marital satisfaction 
were computed in SPSS (version 25). 

Results: Forty-five of the fifty questionnaires were returned completed. Fifty-one percent of respondents were 
female. The majority (44%) were between the ages of 41-50 years. 81% were married and living with spouses. 
Average year of marriage was 13.5 years. The majority (85%) of respondents were married in Nigeria with only 
one spouse immigrating first (35%). The primary reason for immigration was employment for most subjects 
(48%). Seventy-two percent of the respondents scored < 30 on the IMS scale, indicating marital satisfaction. The 
scores were not significant when compared within the demographic variable groups. Most participants (71.4%) 
reported significant marital satisfaction (Z=-3.209, p=0.001. r = 0.47).  

Conclusion: Initial pilot study did not support the observation in the Nigeria community regarding stressful 
marital relationships among NINA. The IMS tool may not be sensitive to the Nigerian marriage culture and 
possible factors affecting marital satisfaction with cultural influence. The authors plan to conduct a more 
extensive study with a qualitative approach to elicit the Nigerian culturally sensitive factors. 

Keywords: Index of Marital Satisfaction (IMS), marital satisfaction, immigrants, Nigeria, Seventh Day 
Adventist (SDA), West Africa, North America 

1. Introduction 

Reports indicate that Africans, Nigerians included, consist of a small, but growing segment of the United States 
immigrant population and since 1970 the number of immigrants has been doubling every decade (Anderson, 2017). 
Africans are one of the fastest growing groups migrating to the U.S., which is apparent by the increase of 137% 
between 2000 and 2013 (Anderson, 2017). Anderson and Lopez (2018) shared that the black African immigrants’ 
population more than doubled in the U.S, from 574,000 to 1.6 million, between 2000 and 2016. The census data 
also indicated that 35% of African Immigrants originated from West Africa of which over a third (38.7%) are from 
Nigeria while the rest are from Ethiopia, Ghana, Kenya, and Egypt. The largest African Immigrant populations are 
found in California, New York, Texas, Maryland and Virginia.  

Studies conducted in the past provide substantial evidence that Nigerian immigrants who live in the United States, 
are often in situations that lead to stress for married couples. Issues arising from internal and external conflicts may 
grow as more Nigerians migrate. The dream of a better life is a reason that Nigerian immigrants leave their home 
country. The reputation of another country, like the United States, attracts millions (Woodgate, et al., 2017). The 
reality is that they are often oblivious of the challenges or obstacles that families can face. 

Bucher-Maluschke, Gondim, and Pedroso (2017) presented an analogy that was based on a qualitative study that 
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focused on the emotional and mental effects of being immigrants. It was shared that “migration turns into one of 
the contingencies of life that can cause psychological disorganization” (Bucher-Maluschke et al., 2017). When 
people move their residence from one country to another, they face realities that Obikor & Afolayan (2007) 
described as “age-long cargo of dilemma.” Immigrants generally have to wrestle with cultural conflicts, culture 
shock, and intergenerational contestation. Donkor (2012) observed that the “act of Immigration” amongst 
Ghanaian Immigrants required adjustments and radical shifts in perceptions, aspirations, desires, and expectations.  

Immigrant families living in the United States of America generally experience stressors that directly impact 
family functioning Obiakor & Afolayan (2007) posited that while Africans living in Africa have their portion of 
challenges. Africans living in America have more stringent burdens that erode resiliency which leads to high-stress 
levels and high rates of divorce. 

The immigrant Nigerian family unit struggles to maintain a balance between growing individually and maturing 
concerning the area’s system. One coping strategy that immigrants use to meet the challenges is clustering 
(Hamilton, Easley, & Dixon, 2018). This means marriage partners who migrate together seek jobs in geographic 
areas that bring a level of comfort and acceptance. In these areas the immigrant families can hold on to some of the 
cultural ways of dressing, eating, celebrating and expressing themselves, which help them to maintain strong 
marriage ties (Hamilton, Easley, & Dixon, 2018). Another study focused on how the marriages of African 
immigrants were influenced by race-ethnicity, generational status, and first marriage (Thomas, 2017). Thomas 
(2017) commented that “as assimilation increases, immigrants are less likely to have outcomes that are consistent 
with a retreat from marriage” (p. 1278). 

This study, therefore, sought to add knowledge that will foster a better understanding of the marital challenges 
faced by NINAs as a significant immigrant population in North America. 

2. Methodology 

This was a cross-sectional pilot study utilizing a standardized survey tool (Index of Marital Satisfaction-IMS). 
Research approval was obtained from the Chicago State University Institutional Review Board, where the 
Principal Investigator was working at the time of the data collection. The participants were all Nigerians, married, 
or previously married to a Nigerian and resident in North America for at least one year by the time of data 
collection. 

Sixty-five questionnaires were administered during a Nigerian camp meeting in Michigan. This was a convenience 
sample of subjects interested in completing the survey after the study was introduced at the camp meeting. The 
total number of adult campers was 76. The camp meeting was a church organized meeting where the majority were 
Seventh Day Adventists and <5% of campers were members of a different denomination or religion. The 
completion of the survey questionnaire implied consent. A study description with implied consent information was 
attached as the first page of the survey tool.  

The IMS is a 25-item scale developed by Hudson (1997). The tool utilized a 5-point Likert format, with responses 
ranging from 1 (strongly disagree) to 5 (strongly agree). Examples of items on the tool include: ‘‘my partner treats 
me badly;’’ and “I feel that I no longer care for my partner.” IMS has demonstrated a high level of reliability (a 
= .96), with a test-retest correlation of .96 (Hudson 1997). The score varied from 0-100 with a lower score (<30 
points) indicating marital satisfaction. Participants also completed a demographic questionnaire showing their age, 
years of marriage, who migrated first, where the marriage was contracted, primary reason for immigration, and 
length of stay in the USA before uniting with a spouse if applicable.  

Data analysis was completed using SPSS (version 25). Descriptive statistics were done on demographic variables. 
Because the IMS score variable was not normally distributed, a one sample Sign Test was conducted to determine 
if observed NINA scored significantly less than 30 points on their IMS. The median IMS scores between the 
different demographic groups were also compared using the Mann-Whitney and Kruskal-Wallis Tests. 

3. Results 

Table 1 highlights the demographics of the participants of this pilot study. Majority of the respondents were 
females (51%). There were older and younger age groups responding to the questionnaire with the majority (44%) 
between the ages of 41-50 years. The participants were all married, and most lived with their spouse (81%). Only 
four subjects claimed to be married but emotionally separated from a spouse. The average length of marriage in 
this study was 13.5 ± 11.6 years, with 41% of respondents married for over 20 years. Eighty-five percent of the 
marriages were contracted in Nigeria with only four marriages contracted in the USA. Most respondents either 
immigrated alone (36%) first or with spouse (32%) to the United States of America. The primary reason for 
immigration was employment (48%) followed by education (32%). 
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Table 1. Demographics of study participants 

Characteristics N (%) 

Gender (N=45)  

Male 22 (48.9) 

Female 23 (51.1) 

Age group (N=47)  

20 - 30 2 (4.4) 

31 - 40 7 (15.6) 

41 – 50 20 (44.4) 

51 - 60 10 (22.2) 

Above 60 6 (13.3) 

Marital status (N=45)  

Married and living with spouse 38 (80.9) 

Married, spouse living in Nigeria 5 (10.6) 

Married and living together but emotionally separated 4 (8.5) 

Years of marriage (N=45)  

1 - 5 7 (15,2) 

6 - 10 2 (4.3) 

11 - 15 9 (19.6) 

16 - 20 9 (19.6) 

Over 20 19 (41.3) 

Marriage Contracted (N=44)  

Nigeria 37 (84.6) 

USA 4 (9.1) 

Other 3 (6.8) 

Who Immigrated First (N=44)  

Self 16 (36.4) 

Spouse 14 (31.8) 

Together 13 (29.5) 

Child(children) 1 (2.3) 

First Immigration Reason (N=44)  

Education 14 (31.8) 

Employment 21 (47.7) 

To help relatives 9 (20.5) 

 

There was no significant difference in marital satisfaction scores between male and female participants; the 
different age groups; and years of marriage. The marital status, where the marriage was contracted, who 
immigrated first, and the reason for immigration did not make a significant difference for the IMS scores (See 
Table 2 below).  
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Table 2. Median scores of marital satisfaction by demographic characteristics of participants 

Characteristics N (%) Median IMS Score Statistics P Value 

Gender     

Male 22 (44.7) 12.3 U=243, r = 0.005 0.829 

Female 23 (55.3) 18.0   

Age group (N=47)     

20 - 30 2 (4.4) 3.7 H = 8.31 0.81 

31 - 40 7 (15.6) 12.0 df=4  

41 – 50 20 (44.4) 19.0   

51 - 60 10 (22.2) 9.3   

Above 60 6 (13.3) 30   

Marital status (N=45)     

Married and living with spouse 38 (80.9) 10.0 H = 2.02 0.363 

Married, spouse living in Nigeria 5 (10.6) 12.0 df=2  

Married and living together but 
emotionally separated 

4 (8.5) 21.7   

Years of marriage (N=45)     

1 - 5 7 (15,2) 7.33 H = 3.347 0.505 

6 - 10 2 (4.3) 16.7 df=4  

11 - 15 9 (19.6) 38.7   

16 - 20 9 (19.6) 11.3   

Over 20 19 (41.3) 12.0   

Marriage Contracted (N=44)     

Nigeria 37 (84.6) 14.7   

USA 4 (9.1) 4.3 H = 2.63 0.625 

Other 3 (6.8) 38.7 df=2  

Who Immigrated First (N=44)     

Self 16 (36.4) 10.0   

Spouse 14 (31.8) 19.7 H = 1.238 0.744 

Together 13 (29.5) 19.3 df=3  

Child(children) 1 (2.3) -   

First Immigration Reason (N=44)     

Education 14 (31.8) 21.0 H = 1.877 0.391 

Employment 21 (47.7) 19.3 df=2  

To help relatives 9 (20.5) 10.0   

U: Mann-Whitney Test; H: Kruskal-Wallis Test 

 

The analysis of data received showed that seventy one percent of respondents reported marital satisfaction with the 
IMS scores (<30). Twenty four percent or 12 respondents had clinically significant problems with their marriages 
as indicated by IMS interpretation of scores (see Table 3). The one sample sign test indicated that the median 
NINA scores (Mdn=14.7) were significantly lower than the IMS 30 points cutoff, with a small to moderate effect 
size (Z=-3.209, p=0.001. r = 0.47).  
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Table 3. Number of participants by level of marital satisfaction 

Characteristics Score n (%) 

Free of clinically significant problem <30 35 (71.4) 

Have clinically significant problem 30 and above 12 (24.5) 

 

4. Discussion 

This study attempted to capture marital satisfaction in one survey using the IMS tool. It is important to stress that 
one cross-sectional survey may not fully capture marital satisfaction by spouses because present situations usually 
shape human experience and not necessarily by a trajectory of fluctuations in marital evaluations over time 
(Bradbury, Fincham, & Beach, 2000). Nonetheless, a cross-sectional survey is useful for having a glimpse into the 
experience of the participants and will inform the authors regarding the trajectory of future studies in this area. 
Presently, there is a paucity of literature addressing this vital issue.  

In this study, the experience of Nigerians immigrating to the United States of America had been explored 
regarding the impact of this immigration on their marital relationship. The authors did not separate or control for 
factors that may influence the marital satisfaction irrespective of immigration. The pilot study was aimed at giving 
the authors a perspective for a future more extensive research. In Africa, though marriage could be polygamous, 
the participants in this study have monogamous marriages partly because of their educational preparation, 
religious affiliation, and the law in the country they immigrated to (USA).  

The survey tool (IMS) to our knowledge had not been widely used in studies with African population, therefore, 
we critiqued its cultural sensitivities for this population. We observed cultural differences not addressed by the 
IMS tool. According to Ngazimbi (2009), socio-cultural factors that impact marriages from the home country may 
continue to impact marriages in the diaspora. Examples of such factors include the patriarchal systems affecting 
financial control, in-law relationships, and respect for the husbands. These factors were not included in the IMS 
questionnaire. Therefore, the authors realized the need to design a culturally sensitive tool for the Nigerian 
immigrant population or explore other available tools.  

In this pilot study, there was no significant impact of demographic factors like gender and years of marriage. 
Likewise, in the study by Edwin (2017), age, gender, and years of experience were not significant predictors of 
marital satisfaction. In another study by Omolayo, Falegan, & Ajila, (2013), they also observed that years of 
marriage had no influence om marital conflict. The study by Idemudia & Ndlovu (2013) however, found 
significant differences between men and women on three out of their four marital satisfaction subscales. They 
conducted their study using South Africans, which may account for some of the difference in results. If these 
demographic factors were not significant for marital satisfaction, there must be other factors not captured by the 
tool. The authors will continue to explore these factors in future studies. 

The total IMS score was utilized to interpret the level of marital satisfaction. According to the authors of the tool, 
an overall score of less than 30 is interpreted as ‘free of the clinically significant problem’ or having marital 
satisfaction. In this study, 71% of participants reported marital satisfaction. This was a very positive result, and it is 
comparable to the results obtained from the study of public servants in Cross River State, Nigeria. The authors 
reported marital satisfaction to be significantly high. Some of the factors reported by the authors to substantially 
influence marital satisfaction include the number of children, communication, and time spent together (Adigeb & 
Mbua, 2015).  

This study was conducted at the Nigerian Adventist in North America (NANA) annual camp. The Seventh Day 
Adventist church promotes family unity and does not encourage divorce (S.D.A Church, 2019). This may account 
for the higher percentage of marital satisfaction in this study. In their study of a relational approach to religion and 
spirituality in marriage, David & Stafford (2015) reported an individual relationship with God as critical to marital 
quality because it encourages communication between partners and forgiveness. Interestingly, they concluded that 
joint religious communication is more strongly associated with satisfaction with mixed-faith compared to 
same-faith couples. The religious background did not factor into marriage instability between couples with 
different religious background (Animasahun & Fatile, 2011). This phenomenon was not investigated in our study, 
however, more than eighty percent of the participants are of the same faith, and it is believed that religion possibly 
played a role in the high percentage of marital satisfaction within the group studied. Though not significant, the 
small number of participants with clinically significant problems should be counseled. The authors believe that 
marital counseling should also address pertinent cultural issues.  
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Limitations of the study include its small sample size and the homogenous religious group, which makes it 
non-generalizable to the Nigerian population in North America. The authors submit that the IMS tool is not 
sensitive to the cultural aspects of Nigerian marriage and may not adequately capture the areas of dissatisfaction in 
the marriages. 

5. Conclusion 

This was a pilot study to investigate marital satisfaction among Nigerians living in North America. The results of 
the study showed that the number of participants with marital satisfaction is significantly more than the number 
with marital problems. Various demographic factors’ comparisons did not show any significant difference in the 
level of marital satisfaction scores. Though the sample size for this pilot study was small, it was an eye-opener for 
follow up research in this area. There is a dearth of literature addressing the concept studied in the context of 
Nigerian Immigrants, and information gleaned from the research will add to the body of knowledge. The findings 
from this study highlight the need for culturally sensitive tools to measure marital satisfaction among people of 
African heritage, taking into consideration cultural factors. The perceived notion of marital dissatisfaction among 
Nigerians living in North America needs further exploration because the pilot study did not corroborate this notion. 
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